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Director and Officer (“D&O”) liabil-
ity insurance policies usually define
“claim” such that all counts of a lawsuit
constitute a single claim. D&O policies
also contain various exclusions for cer-
tain types of claims such as contractual
liability, unfair competition, antitrust,
professional liability and others. Based
on the definition of “claim” in such poli-
cies, D&O insurers have historically
taken a strict, literal interpretation of
their policies and argued that because all
the counts of a lawsuit comprise a single
claim, if one of the counts of a complaint

burden on the carriers to prove which
expenses pertain to a conclusively non-
covered claim. And if the carrier is unable
to allocate expenses between covered and
non-covered claims, or if an expense
relates to both covered and non-covered
claims, New York courts require the
insurer to advance all defense expenses.

In its March 2010 decision in West-
Point International v. American Interna-
tional South Insurance Company,2 the
New York Appellate Division’s First
Department found the carrier liable for
costs of defending the insured and its
directors against a suit which alleged,
among other things, a claim for breach of
contract which was excluded by the pol-
icy. The underlying action also alleged
seven counts that did not involve a breach
of contract by the insured. The insurer
argued that the one contract claim ren-
dered the entire lawsuit outside the cov-
erage of the policy due to the broad
definition of “claim” in the policy to
include the entire lawsuit. The First
Department characterized the carrier’s
interpretation of its policy as “an unduly
rigid construction … in light of the reali-
ties of litigation, as well as ‘a strained,
implausible reading of the complaint that
is linguistically conceivable but tortured
and unreasonable.’”3 The court unani-
mously affirmed the trial court’s applica-
tion of duty to defend principles in the
context of a duty to reimburse policy by
holding that “the fact that some of the
causes of action in the [underlying]
[c]omplaint might not be covered by the
[p]olicy does not extinguish American
International’s obligation to provide a
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triggers an exclusion the entire lawsuit is
excluded from coverage. 

Corporate policyholders and their
directors and officers, however, will be
heartened by a recent line of New York
cases that rejects D&O carriers’ narrow
interpretation of their policies and finds a
duty to reimburse defense expenses even
if one or more counts of the complaint
are excluded by the policy. New York
courts have imported principles from
cases involving ‘duty to defend’ policies
and applied them to broadly construe
D&O carriers’ duty to reimburse defense
expenses even where one or more of the
counts of the complaint is excluded by
the policy.1 Further, while New York
courts will permit D&O carriers to
apportion expenses between covered and
non-covered claims, they have put the
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intertwined.”10 The Court held that the
carrier must pay for “all defense costs as
incurred…subject to recoupment in the
event it is ultimately determined no cov-
erage was afforded [by the policy].”11

In The Trustees of Princeton Univer-
sity v. National Union Fire Insurance
Company, 12 Princeton University sought
coverage under a non-profit D&O policy
for expenses incurred in defending a suit
brought by dissident trustees alleging
that the University had misappropriated
trust funds. In an unpublished opinion
that was later affirmed by the First
Department, the trial court found that
two of the twelve counts in the underly-
ing action were barred from coverage by
the ‘insured v. insured’ exclusion. The
Court rejected the insurer’s contention
that the two non-covered claims rendered
the entire lawsuit excluded from cover-
age under the policy. The Court held that
the insurer’s right to apportion covered
and uncovered claims is not absolute:
“the insurer is not entitled to apportion
claims at the expense of the insured’s
defense of the underlying action, and if
the insurer cannot allocate during the
underlying action, it must pay all defense
costs as incurred subject to recoup-
ment.”13 Further, the Court approvingly
cited the New Jersey Supreme Court’s
opinion in SL Industries, Inc. v. American
Motorists Insurance Company, holding
that if the carrier is ultimately unable to
apportion defense expenses between
covered and non-covered claims, it must
reimburse the insured for all expenses.14

WestPoint joins a line of New York
cases rebuffing D&O insurers’ attempts
to limit their coverage based on a hyper-
technical construction of their policies.15

Notwithstanding the policy definition of
“claim” as encompassing the entire law-
suit, New York courts will not permit the
presence of one or more excluded causes
of action in a complaint to be fatal to
coverage of the overall lawsuit. It is now
clear that D&O policies providing for a
duty to reimburse defense costs will be
interpreted as having the same “heavy”
defense burden as duty to defend poli-
cies.16 As held most recently in West-
Point, the insurer must pay for all
defense costs as those costs accrue and
wait until resolution of the underlying
suit to recoup payments that are ulti-
mately determined to be outside of the
policy’s coverage. The proverbial dust

defense.”4

In response to the insurer’s contention
that case law interpreting a carrier’s
broad defense obligation under “duty to
defend” policies was irrelevant to a “duty
to reimburse” D&O policy, the Court
found the distinction “not dispositive.”5

The First Department relied on duty to
defend cases interpreting general liability
policies to reach the conclusion that
notwithstanding the D&O policy’s defin-
ition of claim to include all counts of a
lawsuit, the “insurer has a duty to defend
so long as there is any possibility of cov-
erage under the policy, and here the pos-
sibility of coverage has not been
eliminated.”6 The Court ordered AISIC to
reimburse WestPoint for its defense
expenses in the underlying litigation
because AISIC could not show that all of
the underlying allegations were entirely
excluded. The Court held that the policy
required reimbursement of all defense
expenses “subject to recoupment of any
amounts advanced for claims ultimately
determined not to be covered.”7

The recent WestPoint opinion squared
with two other New York decisions: Fed-
eral Insurance v. Kozlowski and The
Trustees of Princeton University v.
National Union Fire Insurance Com-
pany. Both decisions rejected the insur-
ers’ contention that the presence of one
or more excluded claims was fatal to
coverage under their D&O policies and
broadly interpreted the insurers’ duty to
advance defense expenses.

In Kozlowski,8 the insured sought to
recover expenses incurred in the defense
of former Tyco Chief Executive Officer
Dennis Kozlowski in three actions alleg-
ing claims covered by the policy, but also
alleging claims for fraud, misappropria-
tion of assets, and other conduct
excluded under the policy. The insurer
disclaimed any duty to advance defense
expenses based on the policy’s ‘personal
profit’ exclusion (barring coverage for a
claim arising from the insured obtaining
a pecuniary benefit to which he was not
legally entitled). The First Department
affirmed the trial court’s ruling that the
insurer advance defense payments
because “the duty to defend arises when-
ever the underlying complaint alleges
facts that fall within the scope of cover-
age.”9 This principle, the court reasoned,
covers a situation where “covered as well
as noncovered claims…are

must settle in the underlying litigation
before the insurer (with the help of
courts, if necessary) can determine which
defense expenses are properly reim-
bursable and which are recoupable by the
insurer. While New York courts will per-
mit a carrier to recoup defense expenses
attributable to the non-covered claims,
the burden is on the carrier to establish
which expenses pertain to the non-cov-
ered claims. If the carrier is unable to
establish that certain expenses pertain
solely to non-covered claims, the policy-
holder is entitled to full reimbursement
of its defense expenses. Further, the car-
rier may not apportion expenses to the
detriment of the insured and its defense
in the common case where the insured is
defending both covered and non-covered
claims. Finally, by requiring the carriers
to advance all defense expenses subject
to recoupment at the end of the underly-
ing litigation, the courts have shifted the
risk of recouping non-covered fees from
potentially bankrupt policyholders onto
the carriers. 
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